F:\MI3\LARSEN\LARSEN_012.XML

11310 CONGRESS
18T SESSION H o R.

To amend the Procurement Technical Assistance Cooperative Agreement
Program in title 10, United States Code.

(Original Signature of Member)

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. LARSEN of Washington introduced the following bill; which was referred
to the Committee on

A BILL

To amend the Procurement Technical Assistance Cooperative

Agreement Program in title 10, United States Code.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. AMENDMENTS RELATING TO PROCUREMENT

TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE COOPERATIVE
AGREEMENT PROGRAM.

(a) INCREASE IN GOVERNMENT SHARE.—Section

2413(b) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking “one-half”” both places it ap-

O o0 9 N U B W

pears and inserting “65 percent”’; and

f\VHLC\052313\052313.100.xml (550492/1)
May 23, 2013 (1:13 p.m.)



F:\MI3\LARSEN\LARSEN_012.XML

2
| (2) by striking “three-fourths” and inserting
2 “75 percent”’.
3 (b) INCREASE IN LIMITATIONS ON VALUE OF ASSIST-
4 ANCE.—Section 2414(a) of such title is amended—
5 (1) in paragraphs (1) and (4), by striking
6 “$600,000” and inserting “$750,000";
7 (2) in paragraph (2), by striking “$300,000”
8 and inserting “$450,000”; and
9 (3) in paragraph (3), by striking “$150,000”
10 and inserting “$300,000".
fAVHLC\052313\052313.100.xml  (55049211)

May 23, 2013 (1:13 p.m.)




  
    F:\M13\LARSEN\LARSEN_012.XML XXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXX 5/23/2013 13:12 XXXXXXXXXXXXX 05/23/2013 13:11  f:\VHLC\052313\052313.100.xml 05/23/2013 13:13:14 XXXXXXXXXXXXX  1131-0517-580131 550492|1  
 XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX 
 [Discussion Draft] 
    
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 113th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Larsen of Washington introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Procurement Technical Assistance Cooperative Agreement Program in title 10, United States Code. 
 
  
  1. Amendments relating to Procurement Technical Assistance Cooperative Agreement Program
  (a) Increase in Government share Section 2413(b) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
  (1) by striking  one-half both places it appears and inserting  65 percent; and
  (2) by striking  three-fourths and inserting  75 percent.
  (b) Increase in limitations on value of assistance Section 2414(a) of such title is amended—
  (1) in paragraphs (1) and (4), by striking  $600,000 and inserting  $750,000;
  (2) in paragraph (2), by striking  $300,000 and inserting  $450,000; and
  (3) in paragraph (3), by striking  $150,000 and inserting  $300,000.  
 


